
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202223/494 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

29 December 2022 

Subject: 
 

Staff networks events 

 
Please include the information for the current financial year, 2022/23 (to the present) 
  
Q
1 

A list of the events organised by the staff networks 
 
Full details of each event, including  

a. which network ran/hosted the event 
b. the start and end time 
c. the date 
d. whether it was held online or in-person 
e. the length, 
f. the topic and/or title 
g. the number of attendees (if held) 
h. the speaker (if possible) 

  
A
1 

  Event 1 Event 2 

a Managers Network First Five Years group: the audience is medics. 

b 3-4pm 
Please refer to Event 2 1c below for start and end 
times of the meetings 

c 6th December 2022 

Meetings on: 
 

• 26th April 2022 – introduction meeting- 9am-
1pm 

• 8th June 2022- 10am- 12pm 

• 12th September 2022- 9:30am- 1:30pm 

• 14th October 2022- 2pm-4pm 

• 7th November 2022- 9:30am- 1:30pm 

• 14th December 2022-9:30am- 1:30pm 

d 1 face to face meeting held so far 
All meetings were hybrid meetings (Option of 
Teams plus in person attendees) 

e 

1 hour 
 
 Between 2-4 hours 

f 

Managers networking, problem 
solving, opportunity to  
raise issues 

Topics included HR, job planning, presentation 
from Chief Financial Officer, medical report 
writing. 

g Attendance was 10 managers 
Attendance was between 10 and 36 people for 
each meeting 

h Information Not Held Information Not Held 

 
The remaining staff networks (Disability, REACH, LGBTQIA) have recently been established 



 
and the Chairs and Co-Chairs were appointed from 6th January 2023. No information for the 
current financial year is available. The newly appointed Chairs/Co-Chairs are currently in the 
process of planning the network activity for this year. 

 


