

Reference

FOIAH2324/320

Number: From:

Private Individual

Date:

11 September 2023

Subject:

Electronic Patient Record, Patient Portal and Surgical Operating Notes

documentation systems

- Q1 What Electronic Patient Records system does the Trust use?
- A1 Meditech Expanse
- Q2 Does the Trust have a patient portal that allows patients to see their results, letters and appointments?
- A2 Yes, we use Healthcare Comms.
- Q3 If you have surgical departments, how are the operating notes documented?
  - hand-written?
  - using specialised software?
- A3 Clinical notes are recorded onto the Trust's electronic patient record system Meditech Expanse
- Q4 If you have an urology department:
  - a. What software system is used to track the JJ stents (Excel, other 3<sup>rd</sup> party software)
  - b. What system or software is used to monitor patients with prostate cancer on active surveillance.~
  - c. If 3rd party software is used what is the associated cost?
- A4 a. Surgeons keep track of own list in Excel.
  - b. Information not held not applicable for paediatric patients.
  - c. Information not held no 3<sup>rd</sup> party software used.