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Agency staffign spend and contact details for recruitment leads 

 
 
Q1 The name and best contact details for your  

a. Temporary Staffing Manager,  
b. Procurement category manager for agency suppliers,  
c. Chief People Officer,  
d. Head of recruitment or whoever would be the primary contact responsible for the supply 
of temporary Nursing personnel.  
e. Please can you also provide the details for the primary contact that would be 
responsible for the supply of Doctors and Allied Health Professionals? 
 
Please provide the following where available. 
1. Contact name 
2. Email address 
3. Best contact number 

  
A1 a. Temporary staffing is managed by NHS Professionals. 

b. Procurement Services for the Trust are provided by Health Procurement Liverpool, 
wcf-tr.healthprocurementliverpool@nhs.net. 

c. Melissa Swindell, Melissa.Swindell@alderhey.nhs.uk 
d. As per A1a. 
e. As per A1a. 

  
Q2 Total spend on agency Nurses, Doctors and Allied Healthcare professionals for the last 

financial year with framework agencies? 
  
A2 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2023/24 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref:157: 
https://www.alderhey.nhs.uk/about/foi/disclosure-logs/  

  
Q3 Total spend on agency Nurses, Doctors and Allied Healthcare professionals for the last 

financial year with off-framework agencies broken down by profession or specialty? 
  
A3 Information not held – no off-framework agencies used 
  
Q4 Number of off-framework agencies utilised by the Trust in the last financial year? 
  
A4 Information not held – as per A3 
  
Q5 Average fee charged by the off-framework agencies utilised in the last financial year? 
  



 
A5 Information not held – as per A3 
  
Q6 Current areas of struggle where off-framework agencies are still being utilised? 
  
A6 Information not held – as per A3 
  
 


