

Reference FOIAH2324/593

From: Private Individual

Number:

Date: 24 January 2024

Subject: Spend for education and training

- Q1 How much did your Trust spend in total on education and training in the following financial years?
 - a. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - b. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)
- A1 Please note that we are unable to provide the full detail in respect of Q1 and Q2 as the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data

Apprenticeship training ONLY information below:

- a. April to March 2021 2022: £305,201
- b. April to March 2022 2023: £333,581
- Q2 Please advise how much of this total spend was with external providers?

a. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) b. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)

- A2 All of the above spend (A1) was with external providers and for apprenticeship training ONLY.
- Q3 Please can you break down the overall spend into the following categories?
 - a. Apprenticeship training
 - i. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - ii. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)
 - b. Mandatory, statutory and compliance training
 - i. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - ii. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)
 - c. Management and Leadership training
 - i. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - ii. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)
 - d. Healthcare support worker training
 - i. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - ii. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)

Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust

- e. Nursing
 - i. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - ii. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)
- f. Allied Healthcare Professionals
 - i. April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend)
 - ii. April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend)
- A3 a. Apprenticeship training
 - a. April to March 2021 2022: £305,201
 - b. April to March 2022 2023: £333,581

b – f: Information not held – the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data. We do not hold a spend breakdown to this level for these categories.

Q4 What are the top five categories that you procure externally?

A4 Apprenticeship training across a number of training providers / apprenticeship standards Courses in respect of High Dependency Care / Critical Care Courses focused on Clinical Examination Prescribing related courses Leadership and Management