Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOIAH2425/272

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 27 August 2024

Subject: Off framework agency use and spend 2024

Q1 From 1st January 2024 to 1st August 2024, please list the wards/departments you have
requested shifts for off framework agencies in your Adult Nursing, Mental Health,
Community Teams?

A1 Information not held — we have not used off-framework agencies

Q2 From 1st January 2024 to 1st August 2024 have you requested shifts for off framework
agencies in your Urgent treatment centre/ Urgent care centre/ Minor injuries Unit
(UTC/UCC/MIU?).

A2 Information not held — we have not used off-framework agencies

Q3 Please provide me with the name, contact number & email address of the person
responsible for agreeing temporary nursing agency contracts for your Trust?

A3 NHS Professionals (NHSP)
alderhey@nhsprofessionals.nhs.uk

Q4 Please provide a list of off-framework agencies used by the trust from 1st January 2024
to August 1st 2024.

A4 Information not held — we have not used off-framework agencies

Q5 How much was your Off-Framework agency spend for each of the following staff groups
between January 1st 2024 — 1 August 2024
(a) Registered General nurse (RGN'’s)
(b) Registered Children's Nurse (RCN’s)
(c) Registered mental health nurse (RMN)
(d) Intensive Therapy unit nurse (ITU)
(e) Accident and Emergency nurse (A&E)
(f) Healthcare Assistant (HCA)
(g) Community Psychiatric Nurse (CPN)

A5 Information not held — we have not used off-framework agencies

Q6 How much was your off framework spent for (a) Urgent Treatment Centre (b) Urgent
Care Centre (c) Minor Injuries Unit?

A6 Information not held — we have not used off-framework agencies
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