

Reference Number: From:	FOIAH2425/465
	Private Individual
Date:	18 November 2024
Subject:	Number of beds, X-ray, MRI & radiotherapy machines

- Q1 The number of hospital beds which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.
 - a. 172 b. 0 c. 0

A1

- Q2 The proportion of hospital beds which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.
- A2 a. 98.9%
 - b. 0%
 - c. 0%
- Q3 a. The average age of and b. the oldest hospital bed at your NHS Trust.
- A3 a. 9 years b. 9 years
- Q4 The number of any X-Ray machines which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.
- A4 a. 21 b. 0
 - b. 0 c. 0
- Q5 The proportion of any X-Ray machines which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.
- A5 a. 80.7%
 - b. 0
 - c. 0
- Q6 a. The average age of and b. the oldest of any X-ray machine at your NHS Trust.
- A6 a. 7.15 years b. 9 years
- Q7 The number of MRI machines which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.



- A7 a. 2 b. 0
 - c. 0
- Q8 The proportion of MRI machines which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.
- A8 a. 66%
 - b. 0
 - c. 0
- Q9 a. The average age of andb. the oldest MRI machine at your NHS Trust.
- A9 a. 6.1 years b. 9 years
- Q10 The number of radiotherapy machines which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old
- A10 Information not held we do not have radiotherapy machines.
- Q11 The proportion of radiotherapy machines which are aged over a) 5 years old, b) 10 years old, c) 20 years old.
- A11 Information not held as per A10
- Q12 The average age of and the oldest radiotherapy machine at your NHS Trust.
- A12 Information not held as per A10
- Q13 What computer operating system does your NHS use and when did your Trust first start to use it?
- A13 Windows 10 Enterprise 08/07/2022