

**Reference Number:** FOIAH2425/486  
**From:** Private Individual  
**Date:** 22 November 2024  
**Subject:** Staff psychology/counselling service

- Q1 For each year from 1st January 2010 to 31st December 2023, the number of resident doctors (previously referred to as "junior doctors") who accessed the Trust's staff psychology service whilst employed in such a role at the Trust.
- a. This includes any such doctors working in training positions on external premises (e.g. GP practices) whilst still under the umbrella of the Trust.
- A1 [Information not held – We are unable to provide a breakdown of specific roles as our dataset identifies job roles at a more generic professional level such as "medical/dental".](#)
- Q2 For each year from 1st January 2010 to 31st December 2023, the number of resident doctors (previously referred to as "junior doctors") who accessed the Trust's staff counselling service whilst employed in such a role at the Trust.
- a. This includes any such doctors working in training positions on external premises (e.g. GP practices) whilst still under the umbrella of the Trust
- A2 [Information not held – as per A1](#)
- Q3 For each month during the years 2019-2023, the number of resident doctors (previously referred to as "junior doctors") who accessed the Trust's staff psychology service whilst employed in such a role at the Trust.
- a. This includes any such doctors working in training positions on external premises (e.g. GP practices) whilst still under the umbrella of the Trust.
- A3 [Information not held – as per A1](#)
- Q4 For each month during the years 2019-2023, the number of resident doctors (previously referred to as "junior doctors") who accessed the Trust's staff counselling service whilst employed in such a role at the Trust.
- a. This includes any such doctors working in training positions on external premises (e.g. GP practices) whilst still under the umbrella of the Trust.
- A4 [Information not held – as per A1](#)