

Reference FOIAH2425/489

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 25 November 2024

Subject: Insourcing spending for the last three financial years

- Q1 What was the Trust's total insourcing spending for the last three financial years (ending March)?
- A1 21/22 £553,866 22/23 - £642,382 23/24 - £1,222,897
- Q2 What was the Trust's total insourcing spending on the following for the last three financial years (ending March)?
 - a) ophthalmology
 - b) gastroenterology
 - c) dermatology
 - d) ENT
- A2 a c) Information not held no insourcing used for these departments in the last three financial years

d)

21/22 - Information not held - no insourcing used

22/23 - Information not held - no insourcing used

23/24 - £84,000

- Q3 What was the Trust's total insourcing spending on
 - a) 18 Week Support
 - b) Medinet
 - c) HBS UK (Healthcare Business Solutions UK)
- A3 a-c) Zero